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Call for Abstracts  
for 9th International Conference on Geosynthetics 

 
For the 9th International Conference 
on Geosynthetics (9ICG, Brazil, 23 - 
27 May 2010) the Call for Abstracts 
is open. 

Abstracts of individuals shall be 
uploaded at 

www.9icg-brazil2010.info  
before 30 October 2008 

Papers may cover any of the topics 
listed in the full announcement for 
9ICG on page 12. 
The abstracts are limited to 500 
words. According to the regulations 
by the International Geosynthetics 
Society, an author can have only 
one paper with his name as the 1st 
author (no limit for papers as 
co-author). 

In addition, chapters of the IGS can 
submit up to 10 papers on “Case 
Histories of Geosynthetics Engi-
neering Practice” in addition to 
submissions from individuals. 

Abstracts of IGS Chapters shall 
be uploaded at 

www.9icg-brazil2010.info  
before 28 February 2009 
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President’s Corner 
 

 Fumio Tatsuoka 
 
From 16 - 20 June 2008 I partici-
pated in the 4th Geosynthetics Asia 
2008, in Shanghai, China. In the 
opening ceremony, I showed the 
following figure that was prepared 
by the IGS Vice President Prof. 
Jorge Zornberg. 
This is clearly showing that the IGS 
has been growing consistently. I 
also delivered a special lecture enti-
tled “GEOSYNTHETICS ENGI-
NEERING COMBINING TWO EN-
GINEERING DISCIPLINES”, with 
particular reference to geosyn-
thetic-reinforced soil retaining walls. 
This is a detailed explanation of the 
issue discussed in Editorial of the 
IGS News, Vol. 23, No. 3, Novem-
ber 2007. I emphasized, in particular, 
the following two points: 
• With geosynthetic reinforcement, 

soil and geosynthetic-reinforced 
soil structures, creep is not a me-
chanical degrading phenomenon, 
but it is simply an elasto - visco-

plastic response of a material or a 
system. With geosynthetic rein-
forcement, the tensile rupture 
strength at a given strain rate 
does not decrease by creep load-
ing history and therefore it does 
not decrease with time unless 
chemical and/or biological de-
grading effects are significant. 

• As the backfill exhibits creep de-
formation, the tensile load in the 
polymer reinforcement members 
that are arranged in the backfill 

may decrease with time unless the 
safety factor of the geosyn-
thetic-reinforced soil structure is 
unusually low. 

The lecture note and the slides of 
the presentation as PDF-file can be 
downloaded from: 
http://www.rs.noda.tus.ac.jp/soil/ind
ex.htm 
 
Fumio Tatsuoka 
IGS President 
 

Results of IGS Council Election 
Term 2008 to 2012 

 
A total of 11 candidates ran for eight 
council positions on the IGS Council 
for the 2008 to 2012 term. The elec-
tion was held by electronic ballot in 
May 2008 with about 480 votes cast 
(25 % of the membership). 
Congratulations to the new and re-
elected Council members: 
 
Dennes T. Bergado (Thailand) 

 
 

Abdelmalek Bouazza (Australia) 

 
Pierpaolo Fantini (Italy) 

 

Han-Yong Jeon (Korea) 

 
 
Russell Jones (UK) 
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Jiro Kuwano (Japan) 

 

Mike Sadlier (Australia) 

 

Martin Ziegler (Germany) 

 
 

 
Report of the 

IGS Officers Meeting Shanghai, 16 June 2008 
 

Peter E. Stevenson 
 
President Tatsuoka called the 
meeting to order at 0900. Present 
were President F. Tatsuoka, Vice 
President J. Zornberg, Past Presi-
dent D. Cazzuffi, Treasurer J. Cow-
land, Secretary P. Stevenson, Se-
cretariat Manager R. Stevenson. 
Officers, committee and council 
minutes from GeoAmericas 2008 
(Cancun) were reviewed. Under 
matters arising it was noted that 
Prof Tang is now Secretary of 
CCIGS (Chinese Chapter of the 
IGS). The IGS website will be 
amended accordingly. 
The Secretary reported on various 
items including the several 
award/recognition programs un-
derway in 2008 (IGS Awards, Stu-
dent Awards, Corporate Member 
Recognition, Council Service Rec-
ognition, and Chapter nominations 
for the IGS Achievement Award). It 
was noted that the GeoSynthetics 
Asia 2008 conference opening 
ceremony would include the pres-
entation of five Student Awards, 

three Council Service Recognition 
awards, two Chapter nominated IGS 
Achievement Awards and two Cor-
porate Member Recognition Awards. 
Each of these programs will be re-
peated at EuroGeo4 in Edinburgh 
following the IGS Awards ceremony. 
Past President Cazzuffi reported 
that the IGS may be able to reach 
past council member Heinrich 
Schneider in order to present the 
Council Service recognition award. 
Two nominations have been re-
ceived for the Giroud Lecture, the 
lecturer will be chosen by the newly 
formed council in Edinburgh. The 
lecture will be presented to the 9th 
ICG in May 2010. 
A discussion was held concerning 
chapters that are delinquent in re-
porting to and in communicating 
with the IGS. Vice President Zorn-
berg was tasked with drafting a pol-
icy to encompass withholding of 
chapter rebates and other chapter 
benefits and incentives from inactive 
chapters, and consideration of the 
possibility of revoking the chapter’s 
approval in the case of a completely 
inactive chapter. The election or 
reelection of eight members to the 
council was noted. The initial meet-
ing of the new council will be held in 
Edinburgh on September 7, 2008. 
The new council members are wel-
come to attend the IGS Committee 
meetings which will be held on 
September 6, 2008. The July issue 

of the IGS News in is preparation. It 
was agreed that the November is-
sue should be the main celebratory 
issue for the 25th Anniversary of the 
IGS. 
The Treasurer reported that the IGS 
finances remained in good condi-
tion. 
Committees: The Asian Activities 
Committee is scheduled to meet at 
1500 on June 16, 2008 immediately 
following the officers meeting. The 
primary task of the AAC is to rec-
ommend the venue for GeoSyn-
thetics Asia 2012. The committee’s 
recommendation will be approved 
by council in Edinburgh. The Inter-
national Promotion Committee for 
the 9th ICG (Brazil) plans to meet on 
Wednesday June 18, 2008 at 1300. 
The IGS Awards Committee plans 
to meet in Shanghai, on Wednesday 
June 18, 2008 at 1600. Minutes of 
these meetings will be kept and 
published by the chairmen as ap-
propriate. 
Conferences: Planning and status of 
several IGS events were reviewed 
and all indications are that Euro-
Geo4 in Edinburgh, September 
2008, GeoAfrica 2009 in Capetown 
and the 9th ICG in Guarujá, Brazil in 
2010 are all in good order.  
 
reported by  
Pete Stevenson, IGS Secretary
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In Memoriam  
Jim Paul 

 

 
 
The geosynthetics industry lost a 
true gentleman on 25 June 2008 
when Jim Paul, former CEO of 
Tensar International, passed away 
suddenly aged 59.  
He joined Tensar in 1982 (at that 
time trading as Netlon Ltd) and 
during his appointment in several 
senior positions he became a well 
liked, respected and indispensable 
figurehead within the company.  
Jim’s expertise was instrumental in 
positioning Tensar as the global 
market leader within its field and in 
2004 he assumed the role of CEO. 
In the same year received a coveted 
industry accolade from IGS for his 
dedication and deliverance during 
his service, which he deservingly 
received with great pride. 
Jim obtained his civil engineering 
degree from the University of 
Strathclyde. Where amongst others 
he was taught by Professor Alan 
McGown, with whom he became a 

lifelong friend. Jim’s career experi-
ence was in general civil engineer-
ing design and construction with 4 
years in a local authority, 2 years 
with contractor and 8 years with 
consulting engineers. 
On joining Netlon Ltd he began as 
the Area Civil Engineer for Scotland 
and Ireland and later added Scan-
dinavia to his area of responsibility. 
Jim’s potential was quickly realised 
by the company, and he went on to 
become the UK Sales Manager, 
then commercial Director where he 
saw the company through a suc-
cessful buy-out from the owner Dr 
Brian Mercer. Jim eventually went 
on to become CEO of what was by 
that time re-named The Tensar 
Group. In 2006 he steered the 
company through a highly success-
ful sale to US ‘sister company’ Ten-
sar Corporation, after which he de-
cided to take an early retirement. 
Jim was a great supporter and ad-
vocate of the IGS. After serving on 
the UK committee for some time he 
became chairman of the UK Chap-
ter from 1993 to 1995 and following 
that he was elected to IGS Council 
from 1996 to 2004., while acting as 
chair of the Education Committee 
(1996 - 2002) and the European 
Activity Committee (2002 - 2004). 
Jim’s service to IGS was valued 
greatly by his peers. 

As an indication of how seriously 
Jim took his commitment to the 
geosynthetic industry, was awarded 
an MPhil in 1994 while a Director of 
Tensar for a dissertation on “The 
Development, Testing & Rein-
forcement Applications of 
Geogrids”.  
Jim had a personality and way of 
working that endeared him to both 
colleagues and competitors in the 
field. He was extremely well re-
spected in the industry and was 
considered to be a ‘gentleman’ by 
those that had the privilege to work 
for him or with him. 
“It is difficult to do Jim justice on 
both a professional and personal 
level in so few words,” says Tensar 
International’s Chief Engineer and 
past UK Chapter Chairman, Chris 
Jenner, who has worked alongside 
Jim for many years. “Aside from 
being a pleasure to work with, he 
was a geotechnical mastermind and 
his passion for the profession was 
evident in everything he put his 
mind to". 
The UK Chapter is currently inves-
tigating a way to commemorate 
Jim's contribution to IGS and will 
announce the tribute at EuroGeo4 in 
Edinburgh. 
 
Russell Jones, IGS UK Chapter 
Chairman  
 

 

Conference Reports 
 

International Symposium on Geotechnical Engineering, 
Ground Improvement and Geosynthetics 

for Human Security and Environmental Preservation 
6 - 7 December 2007, Bangkok, Thailand 

 
The International Symposium on 
Geotechnical Engineering, Ground 
Improvement and Geosynthetics for 
Human Security and Environmental 
Preservation was held on 6 to 7 
December 2007 at Miracle Grand 
Convention Hotel, Bangkok, Thai-

land. Details of the topics include: 
Design and Applications of Geo-
synthetics, Soil Improvement, New 
Challenge in Dam Engineering, 
Slope and Embankment Rein-
forcement, Erosion Control, Tsu-
nami Reconstruction, etc. The 

Symposium was officially opened by 
Dr. Monthip Sriratana Tabucanon, 
Director-General of the Department 
of Environmental Quality and Pro-
motion of the Ministry of Natural 
Resources and Environment 
(MONRE). 
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The two-day Symposium had an 
impressive line up of speakers in-
cluding Prof. Fumio Tatsuoka of 
Tokyo University of Science and 
President of the International Geo-
synthetics Society (IGS) as well as 
Prof. Pedro Pinto of the University of 
Coimbra, Portugal and President of 
the International Society of Soil 
Mechanics and Geotechnical Engi-
neering (ISSMGE). There were 

more than 120 
speakers, ses-
sion chairs, 
delegates, ex-
hibitors, and 
sponsors from 23 
countries includ-
ing Australia, 

Bangladesh, 
China, Germany, 
Greece, Indone-
sia, Hong Kong, 
Japan, India, 
Philippines, Sin-
gapore, U.S.A., 
U.K., Russia, 

Switzerland, 
Sweden, Taiwan, Turkey, and, of 
course, Thailand. In addition, there 
were 13 Exhibitors and 12 Spon-
sors.  
This Symposium served as a forum 
for the geotechnical and geosyn-
thetic professionals as a whole, and, 
in particular those who are involved 
in disaster prevention, mitigation, 
rehabilitation, and construction 

works for human security. It is our 
fervent hope that this Symposium 
will encourage research activities as 
well as promote environmental 
preservations in Thailand. Already, 
geosynthetics are being used for 
erosion control along Chao Phraya 
River banks as well as in the shore-
lines of the Gulf of Thailand. 
 
Reported by 
D. Bergado, IGS Thailand President 
 

 

Giroud Gives 44th ASCE Terzaghi Lecture 
Geo-Congress 2008, 9 - 12 March 2008, New Orleans, USA 

 
In front of a packed house of over 
500 attendees, Dr. J.P. Giroud, Past 
President of the IGS, delivered the 
American Society of Civil Engineers 
(ASCE) 44th Terzaghi Lecture. The 
lecture was delivered on March 11, 
at GeoCongress’08, the 2008 An-
nual Meeting of the ASCE 
Geo-Institute (G-I) in New Orleans, 
Louisiana, USA.  
The Terzaghi Lecture has been es-
tablished in recognition of the pio-
neering work of Karl Terzaghi 
(1883-1963) who is recognized as 
the father of modern geotechnical 

engineering. The Terzaghi lecture 
has been generally considered as 
the ASCE’s top honor in geotech-
nical engineering since Dr. Ralph 
Peck gave the first Terzaghi Lec-
ture in 1963. G-I President Art 
Hoffman opened the proceedings, 
noting that Dr. Giroud was selected 
to give the lecture “In recognition of 
your pioneering work and leader-
ship in the development of the field 
of geosynthetics engineering and 
associated contributions to civil and 
geotechnical engineering.”  
Providing a bridge back to one of 

Terzaghi’s 
seminal contribu-
tions to the geo-
technical field, Dr. 
Giroud then de-
livered his lecture 
on “Filter Criteria”, 
presenting a co-
herent and uni-
fied theory of 
filtration applica-
ble to both 
granular and 
geotextile filters. 
The lecture 
showed that, due 

to differences in geometry between 
granular and geotextile filters, the 
formulation of criteria must be differ-
ent for these two types of filters and 
that simply adapting the well-known 
Terzaghi criteria for granular filters 

Ribbon-cutting for the Exhibition Booths  

 

 
Dr. Giroud presenting the Karl Terzaghi Lecture 

ASCE Past President Dr. William Marcuson 
(right) presents Dr. Giroud the plaque for the 
Karl Terzaghi Lecture 

Opening Ceremony on 6 December 2007 of the International 
Symposium on Geotechnical Engineering, Ground Improvement 
and Geosynthetics for Human Security and Environmental Pres-
ervation 
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to geotextile filters is not correct and 
can lead to unsafe filter design. The 
lecture also showed that criteria for 
granular filters can be improved 
using developments made for geo-
textile filters, thereby leading to 
safer designs for granular filters. Dr. 
Giroud’s lecture showed that the 
development of filter criteria for geo-
textile filters, which started as tech-
nology transfer from soil mechanics 
to geosynthetic engineering, has 
now resulted in technology transfer 

from geosynthetic engineering back 
to soil mechanics. 
At the conclusion of the lecture, the 
packed auditorium gave Dr. Giroud 
a standing ovation in recognition of 
his outstanding presentation and 
ASCE Past President and former 
Terzaghi lecturer Dr. William Mar-
cuson presented Dr. Giroud with the 
plaque and honorarium commemo-
rating the lecture. 
The evening concluded with a gala 
dinner honoring Dr. Giroud and his 

wife that was attended by the G-I 
Board of Governors, eight former 
Terzaghi lecturers, the French Con-
sul General for the southern United 
States, and other dignitaries. 
Dr. Giroud’s lecture will be pub-
lished in a future volume of the 
ASCE Journal of Geotechnical and 
Geoenvironmental Engineering. 
 
Reported by  
IGS member Ed Kavazanjian 
 

 

Sixth RILEM Int. Conf. on Cracking in Pavements  
15 - 19 June 2008, Chicago, USA 

 

The Sixth RILEM International 
Conference on Cracking in Pave-
ments convened from June 15 - 19 
in Chicago, Illinois. The conference 
was truly an international one with 
nearly 200 attendees from 29 coun-
tries. This year marked the first time 
the conference was held in the 
United States, and the attendees 
enjoyed various sights of Chicago, 
including a private reception and 
dinner at the Shedd Aquarium. 

IGS member Imad Al-Qadi, Director 
of the Illinois Center for Transporta-
tion and Founder Professor at the 
University of Illinois at Ur-
bana-Champaign, served as Con-
ference Chair. Tom Scarpas and 
Andreas Loizos served as co-chairs. 
David Lippert of the Illinois Depart-
ment of Transportation provided 
welcoming remarks for the confer-
ence, and the keynote address, 
"Concrete Cracking: Measuring, 

Modeling, and Mitigating" was given 
by Surendra P. Shah of Northwest-
ern University. The conference in-
cluded the presentation of 89 pa-
pers from more than 20 countries. 
 
Reported by 
Leslie Sweet Myrick 
 

 

Geo-Environmental Engineering 2008 
12-14 June 2008, Kyoto, Japan 

 
Geo-Environmental Engineering 
2008 (GEE 2008, or 8th Ja-
pan-Korea-France-Canada Joint 
Seminar on Geoenvironmental En-
gineering) was held on June 12-14, 
2008 at the Clock Tower Centennial 
International Hall, Kyoto University, 
Kyoto, Japan. The Conference was 
jointly organized by Kyoto University, 
Japan, Seoul National University, 
Korea Institute of Construction 

Technology, Korea, University Jo-
seph Fourier of France, and the 
University of British Colombia Can-
ada. It was held under the auspices 
of the International Geosynthetics 
Society (IGS) and the Japanese 
Geotechnical Society (JGS), and 
supported by the Society for Mate-
rials Science, Japan (JSMS). 

 

Participants 
78 full registrants from 13 countries, 
including 2 invited plenary speakers, 
participated in the conference. 45 
persons were invited to contribute 
oral presentations. 

Conference papers and proceed-
ings 
The 45 accepted papers were in-
cluded in the Conference Proceed-

 
Cover of RILEM brochure 
 

David Lippert of the Illinois Department of Transportation 
welcomes attendees to Chicago.  
 

Co-Chair Andreas Loizos and Chair Imad 
Al-Qadi enjoying the RILEM banquet at the 
Shedd Aquarium 
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ings. PDF files of these papers are 
also available on the IGS web-site. 

Conference program 
Presentation of the oral papers and 
discussion were divided into seven 
technical sessions. 

Technical Sessions 
1. Characterization, Fate and 

Transport of Contaminants 
(Chaired by Prof. Catharine 
Mulligan of Concordia University, 
Canada) 

2. Geotechnics of Waste Re-
use/Recycle (Chaired by Dr. Ha 
Ik Chung of the Korea Institute 
of Construction and Technology, 
Korea) 

3. Natural Hazards, Mitigation in 
Construction Works (Chaired by 
Dr. Wan Zuhairi Wan Yaacob of 
University Kebangsaan, Malay-
sia) 

4. Barrier, Geosynthetics in 
Geoenvironmental Engineering 
(Chaired by Prof. Takeshi Ka-
tsumi of Kyoto University, Ja-
pan) 

5. Remediation of Soil and 
Groundwater Contamination (1) 
(Chaired by Prof. Loretta Li of 
the University of British Colom-
bia, Canada) 

6. Remediation of Soil and 
Groundwater Contamination (2) 
(Chaired by Prof. Jean-Pierre 
Gourc of the University Joseph 
Fourier, Grenoble, France)) 

7. Management of Landfill 
(Chaired by Prof. Junboum Park 
of Seoul National University, 
Korea) 

A special session entitled “Man-
agement of waste and contaminated 
sites in Asia” was held with the col-
laboration of the Asian Technical 
Committee (ATC17) of ISSMGE 
during the late afternoon of 12 June. 
The contributions not only included 
reports on laboratory tests, theo-
retical modeling and numerical 
analyses, but also covered field 
monitoring results, practical applica-
tions and Asian geo-environmental 
codes and standards. Overall the 
program was comprehensive and 
interesting. 
A one-day site excursion was con-
ducted to visit a newly engineered 

waste landfill called “Clean Center 
Shiga”, as well as Mt. Hiei. 

Special Events 
Five Best Young Presenter awards 
were selected by the organizers. 
These awards were presented to 
the recipients at the closing session. 
The recipients and their topics were 
as follows: 
1. Mr. Giancarlo Flores (Kyoto 

University): Measuring satura-
tion to evaluate LNAPL migra-
tion under fluctuating ground-
water conditions in a porous 
subsurface 

2. Mr. Sungsu Rhee (Seoul Na-
tional University): A 
2-dimensional experiment on 
the partitioning tracer test for 
detecting and quantification of 
petroleum contamination in aq-
uifer 

3. Mr. Yasutaka Watanabe (Iba-
raki University): Degradation 
mechanism of drinking water 
sludge by interaction with water 

4. Mr. Hyunjin Shin (Seoul Na-
tional University): Assessment 
of Pb stabilization techniques in 
Pb-contaminated soils from a 
small arms firing range in South 
Korea 

5. Mr. Naoto Takeuchi (Kyoto 
University): Deformability and 
hydraulic barrier performance of 
fiber-reinforced cement treated 
clay subjected to the cyclic 
loading 

The first evening was dedicated to a 
reception at the International Hall in 
Kyoto University. A farewell Suki-
yaki party was also held at a Japa-
nese restaurant on the final evening. 
Participants enjoyed wonderful food 
and drinks, together with the infor-

 
Participants of GEE 2008 

 
Excursion at GEE 2008 
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mative technical sessions, lively 
discussion and useful social interac-
tion. 

Next Conference 
Geo-Environmental Engineering 
2009 (GEE 2009, or 9th Joint Semi-

nar on Geoenvironmental Engi-
neering) will be held in the spring of 
2009 at the University of British 
Colombia in Vancouver, Canada. 
Details will follow. 
 
 

Reported by  
Masashi Kamon 
Chairman of the GEE2008 organiz-
ing committee, IGS Council member 
 

 

Geosynthetics Asia 2008 
17 - 20 June 2008, Shanghai, China 

 

 
 
Geosynthetics Asia 2008, the 4th 
Asian Regional Conference on 
Geosynthetics, took place at 
Shanghai Exhibition Center in 
Shanghai, China, form June 17 to 
20, 2008. Geosynthetics Asia 2008 
was organized by the Chinese 
Chapter of International Geosyn-
thetics Society (CCIGS) and the 
Chinese Technical Association on 
Geosynthetics (CTAG) with the 
support of the Shanghai Investiga-
tion Design and Research Institute 
(SIDRI), Zhejiang University, and 
Shanghai Hejie Tech & Trading Co. 
Ltd., under the auspices of the In-
ternational Geosynthetics Society 
(IGS) and the Chinese Hydraulic 
Engineering Society (CHES). 
Although some Chinese authors 
cannot attend the conference for the 
big earthquake and the heavy 
flooding in south of China, over 200 
participants from 28 countries and 
regions (Australia, Brazil, Canada, 
Chile, China, France, Germany, 
Greece, Hong Kong China, India, 
Indonesia, Iran, Italy, Japan, Jordan, 
Korea, Malaysia, New Zealand, 
Philippine, Saudi Arabia, Singapore, 

Taiwan, Thailand, Turkey, United 
Arab Emirates, United Kingdom, 
USA, Vietnam et al.) attended the 
conference. Over 60 young engi-
neers, scholars and students at-
tended the training course. Over 66 
companies from 14 countries and 
regions attended the exhibition. 
Under the conference theme ”Geo-
synthetics in Civil and Environmen-
tal Engineering” a total of 238 ab-
stracts were submitted and 157 
papers were collected in the Pro-
ceedings of the 4th Asian Regional 
Conference on Geosynthetics, pub-
lished by Zhejiang University Press 
and Springer. The topics of the re-
search papers were related to fun-
damental principles and properties 
of geosynthetics, testing and test 
standards, physical tests and cen-
trifuge tests, reinforcement, soil im-
provement and ground improvement, 
filter and drainage characteristics, 
landfill engineering, geosystem us-
age, transportation applications, 
geosynthetics - pile support systems 
and geocell usage, hydraulic appli-
cations, ecological techniques and 
case histories. 
Highlights of the technical program 
included a series of outstanding 
special lecture delivered by Prof. F. 
Tatsuoka, Mercer Lecture by Prof. 
Ennio. M. Palmeira, three keynote 
lectures delivered by Prof. N. Ya-
sufuku, Prof. J.P. Gourc and Dr. D. 
Cazzuffi, respectively, and eight 
invited lectures delivered by Mr. H.B. 

Chen, Prof. C.G. Bao, Dr. S.H. 
Chew, Prof. E.C. Shin, Prof. Y.M. 
Chen, Prof. D. Leshchinsky, Prof. D. 
T. Bergado and Mr. Q.J. Fan, re-
spectively. 
The Forum “Geosynthetics in Envi-
ronmental Engineering” around the 
topic “National code in different 
countries about landfill technology 
for municipal solid wastes and haz-
ardous solid wastes” was organized 
by Prof. M. Kamon and Dr. B. Zhu, 
with panel members, Prof. J.G. 
Zornberg, Prof. Ennio M. Palmeira, 
Prof. D.T. Bergado, Prof. J.P. Gourc, 
Mr J. Cowland and Prof. S.S. Kim. 
The program also included a pres-
entation of several IGS Awards, 
including IGS Service Award, IGS 
Achievement Award and IGS Stu-
dent Award. 
Two big projects, Shanghai Lao-
gang Landfill and Shanghai Yang-
shan Deep Harbor were selected for 
Technical Visits. 
IGS Officers Meeting, IGS Asian 
Activities Committee Meeting, IGS 
Awards Committee Meeting, and 
International Promotion Committee 
of the 9ICG were hold. IGS Asian 
Activities Committee Meeting de-
cided that Geosynthetics Asia 2012 
will be held in Bangkok, Thailand. 
 
Reported by 
Xiao-Wu Tang 
Zhejiang University 
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Prof. F. Tatsuoka, Prof. Y.M. Chen, Prof. M. Kamon, Mr. J. Cowland, 
Prof. J.G. Zornberg, Prof. G.X. Li, Mr. P.E. Stevenson, Dr. D.A. 
Cazzuffi during the opening ceremony 
 

Prof. G.X. Li, Chairman of conference, announced the opening of 
Geosynthetics Asia 2008 

  
Prof. C.G. Bao and Prof. M. Kamon received the IGS Service Award 
from IGS President F. Tatsuoka and IGS Secretary P. Stevenson 

Prof. E.C. Shin, Prof. C.G. Bao, Prof. T. Akagi received the IGS 
Council Recognition Award from IGS Past-President D. Cazzuffi and 
IGS Secretary P. Stevenson 
 

  
Prof. C.G. Bao and Prof. T. Akagi receiving the IGS Achievement 
Award (nominated by the IGS Chapters) from IGS Secretary P. Ste-
venson 
 

IGS Student Award presented by IGS Vice-President J. Zornberg and 
IGS Secretary P. Stevenson to J.Saowapakpiboon (Thailand), S. 
Zhang (China), K. Hong (Korea), M. Ghosh (India), H. Aizawa (Japan) 
 

  
The exhibition hall 
 

IGS booth in the exhibition 
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Prof. M. Kamon, Dr. B. Zhu, Prof. D.T. Bergado, Mr J. Cowland, Prof. 
J.P. Gourc, Prof. S.S. Kim, Prof. Ennio M. Palmeira and Prof. J.G. 
Zornberg organized the forum “Geosynthetics in Environmental En-
gineering” 
 

Prof. X.W. Tang, Prof. F. Tatsuoka, Prof. Ennio M. Palmeira, Dr. D.A. 
Cazzuffi and Mr. M. Sadlier attended the CCIGS Banquet 
 

 

MERCEA’08 
8 - 11 July 2008, Reggio Calabria, Italy 

 

 
 
The 2008 Seismic Engineering In-
ternational Conference commemo-
rating the 1908 Messina and Reggio 
Calabria Earthquake MERCEA’08 
was held on 8-11 July 2008 in Alta-
fiumara Resort, Villa S. Giovanni 
(RC), Italy. The Conference topics 
were: Site characterisation, micro-
zonation and site effects; Soil liq-
uefaction and liquefaction coun-
termeasures; Slopes, embank-
ments, dams and waste fills; 
Foundations, and soil-structure in-
teraction; Earth retaining structures 
and geosynthetics; Codes and 
guidelines; Structural engineering; 
Emerging technologies; Numerical 
methods; Passive protection de-
vices and seismic isolation; Ad-
vanced technologies in construction 
and retrofit of structures; Seismic 
risk; Stochastic methods; Structural 
safety and reliability; Structural dy-
namics; Urban planning and poli-
cies for seismic risk reduction. 
The Conference was jointly organ-
ized by the University of Reggio 
Calabria; the University of Messina; 
the University of Catania; the Uni-
versity of Palermo; ENEA (Italian 

National Agency for New Technolo-
gies, Energy and the Environment); 
C.I.Di.S (Centro Interuniversitario di 
Dinamica Strutturale Teorica e 
Sperimentale) and under the aus-
pices of: AGI (Associazione Geo-
tecnica Italiana-Italian Geotechnical 
Society), ASSISI (Anti-Seismic 
System International Society); 
Calabria Regional Council; IGS (In-
ternational Geosynthetics Society) 
and GLIS (Isolation and other an-
tiseismic design strategies). 

More than 260 participants attended 
to the Conference, coming from 
about 30 countries. 
The conference was divided in: in-
vited lectures, panel lectures, spe-
cial sessions and parallel sessions. 
The invited lectures were 18 and the 
presenters were: S. Tobriner (Uni-
versity of California, Berkeley); K. 
Hishihara (Chuo University Tokyo); 
I.M. Idriss (University of California, 
Davis); M. Ghafory-Ashtiany, IIES 
Teheran); P.D. Spanos (Rice Uni-
versity); A. Astaneh-ASL (University 
of California, Berkeley); N.N. Am-
braseys (Imperial College, London); 
M. Nicoletti , L. Luzi, R. Paolucci 
(Italy); M. Calvi (University of Pavia 
and Eucentre); E. Cosenza (Uni-
versity of Naples Federico II); G. 
Bouckovalas (National Technical 
University of Athens); K. Stokoe 
(University of Texas); F. Mazzolani 
(University of Naples Federico II); L. 
Decanini (University of Rome La 
Sapienza); D.M. Wood (University 
of Bristol); M. Maugeri (University of 
Catania); M. Di Paola (University of 
Palermo) and R. Bathurst (Queen’s 
University-RMC). 
The panel lectures were 4 and fo-
cused on Microzonation (Present-
ers: A. Ansal; A. Anastasiadis; F. 
Santucci; J.P. Stewart), Siting (S. 
Foti; G. Lanzo; S. Rampello; F. 
Salgado), Foundations and Soil 
Structure Interaction (G. Mylonakis; 
V. Caputo; K. Pitilakis; A.L. Simo-
nelli), Retaining Structures and 

A group of organizers of Mercea’08: IGS 
Member Nicola Moraci, IGS Council Mem-
ber Michele Maugeri and IGS Member Paolo 
Carrubba (left to right) 
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Geosynthetics (S. Aversa; G. 
Milonakis; P. Carrubba; E. Guler). 
 

 
Richard Bathurst presenting his keynote 
lecture 

The special sessions were 4 and 
focused on Steel Shear Walls for 
Seismic Applications; Understand-
ing the Past, Engineering the Fu-
ture; Seismic Retrofitting for the 
Monumental Cultural Heritage in the 
Mediterranean Basin; Structural 
Control and Monitoring. 35 papers 
were presented. 
The parallel sessions were 12 and 
focused on Structural engineering; 
Passive protection devices; Lique-
faction, Structural dynamics; Site 
characterization and site effects; 
Slopes and dams; Advanced tech-
nologies in construction and retrofit; 
Structural safety and reliability; Re-

taining structures and geosynthet-
ics; Urban planning and policies for 
seismic risk reduction; Foundations 
and soil-structure interaction; Seis-
mic risk.  
More than 200 papers were pre-
sented. 
At the end of each session, a fruitful 
and interesting discussion on the 
different topics took place. 
 
Reported by  
Nicola Moraci, 
IGS Italian Chapter Secretary 
 

 

Announcements of Conferences under Auspices of IGS 
 

EuroGeo 4, 7 - 10 September 2008 
Edinburgh, Scotland, United Kingdom 

 

 
EuroGeo4, the 4th European Geo-
synthetics Conference, will be held 
at the Edinburgh Conference Centre, 
Heriot-Watt University, Scotland, UK, 
from 7 to 10 September 2008. The 
Conference is being organized by 
the UK IGS Chapter under the aus-
pices of the IGS and is supported by 
the British Geotechnical Association, 
Scottish Geotechnical Group, 
Ground Forum and the Engineering 
Group of the Geological Society. 
 

 
 
The theme of the conference is the 
use of geosynthetics in civil engi-
neering applications and it promises 
to be the most successful European 
Geosynthetics Conference yet, with 
a record number of papers (greater 

than 200) having been submitted 
and accepted. Session themes and 
the technical programme are now 
listed on the conference website at 
www.eurogeo4.org so you can plan 
which sessions you want to attend 
now. 
Delegate registration is open via the 
conference website. The early bird 
registration deadline has recently 
been extended until the end of July 
2008. This deadline will not be ex-
tended again, so please visit the 
website soon to register and take 
advantage of the considerable sav-
ings available. 
Three keynote lectures will be given, 
one at the beginning of each day.  
Keynote lecturers are Prof. Colin 
Jones (UK), Natalie Touze-Foltz 
(France) and Grace Hsuan (USA). 
All have consulted widely in pre-
paring their keynotes and have a 
number of co-authors for their pa-
pers. 
The conference also plays host to 
the Mercer Lecture, one of the most 
prestigious in the geosynthetics in-
dustry calendar. We are very lucky 
to have Prof Ennio Palmeira pre-
senting on ‘Modelled and actual 
behaviour of geosynthetics in some 
geotechnical applications’. This 
lecture is open to delegates and 
none delegates alike, aiming to in-
troduce the concept of the use of 

geosynthetics in civil engineering to 
a wider audience. 
 

 
 
Thirty six exhibitors will be present 
throughout the duration of the con-
ference and three one day training 
courses have been developed to 
provide education to those not fa-
miliar with the wide ranging applica-
tion of geosynthetics in civil engi-
neering.  The training courses are 
being run in conjunction with Tho-
mas Telford and can be booked 
directly with Thomas Telford at 
www.tttrain.co.uk. Note that these 
training courses are separate from 
the conference and need to be 
booked in advance. 
The conference organising commit-
tee is looking forward to welcoming 
all delegates and exhibitors to Ed-
inburgh in September 2008 for an 
interesting, informative and exciting 
conference. 
 
Reported by  
Derek Smith, Chair of the  
EuroGeo 4 Organizing Committee 

http://www.eurogeo4.org/�
http://www.tttrain.co.uk/�
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GeoAfrica 2009, 2 - 4 September 2009 
Cape Town, South Africa 

 

 
Geoafrica 2009 will present a forum 
for consulting engineers, manufac-
turers, installers and academics to 
exchange information about current 
and potential applications for geo-
synthetics in Africa. 
This will be the first conference to be 
held under the auspices of the IGS 
and in association with the Geo-
technical Division of the South Afri-
can Institution of Civil Engineering 
(SAICE) in the region, and will pre-
sent an opportunity to meet the top 
geosynthetics specialists and pros-
pects on the continent. Every visitor 
to the exhibition floor will be a po-
tential customer, and professionals 
seeking geosynthetic solutions to 
their challenges will attend each 

technical session. This will be the 
largest gathering of geosynthetics 
professionals seen in Africa to date. 

Exhibition 
The conference will include an ex-
hibition for the specification and 
trade of geosynthetic products and 
technology to users throughout Af-
rica, as well as those wishing to 
make an entry into the continent. 
Details of the conference are cur-
rently being finalized. If you would 
like to participate in this major event 
and receive an invitation to submit a 
technical paper, please send an 
e-mail with your contact details to 
Leslie Ferreira at 

lesley@cebisaconferences.co.za 
and we will put you on the confer-
ence mailing list. 

Language 
English is the official language of 
the conference 

Important Dates 
Abstracts submission deadline:  
30 September 2008  

Abstracts are limited to 350 words. 
Each author will be asked to identify 
the general topic of his/her paper 
from the following list: separation, 
filtration, barriers, drainage, rein-
forcement and erosion control. Ab-
stracts should be submitted via the 
conference web site 

www.GeoAfrica2009.org 
in the Submission/Review Center. 
Deadline for acceptance of ab-
stracts: 30 October 2008 
Receipt of Completed Papers:  
10 December 2008 
Receipt of Final Papers:  
15 April 2009 
Exhibition Stand Sales Closes:  
31 July 2009; there are only 30 
stands available 

For more Information 
Conference & Exhibition & Secre-
tariat: Lesley Ferreira, Email: 
lesley@cebisaconferences.co.za 
Tel: +27 21 559 4574 
Fax: +27 21 559 4574/086 692 7220 
Web site: www.gigsa.org 
 

 

9th International Conference on Geosynthetics – 9ICG 
Guarujá, Brazil, 23 - 27 May 2010 

 

 
 
The 9ICG is being organized by IGS 
Brasil, the Brazilian Chapter of the 
International Geosynthetics Society, 
and ABMS, the Brazilian Associa-
tion for Soil Mechanics and Geo-
technical Engineering, under the 
auspices of IGS, the International 
Geosynthetics Society (IGS) and 
supported by ABINT, the Brazilian 
Association of Nonwoven and 
Technical Textiles Industries. 

Conference Aims 
The aims of this conference are to 
offer: 

• an outstanding opportunity of ex-
change knowledge and experi-
ences between geosynthetic re-
searchers, consultants, owners, 
geotechnical and environmental 
engineers, geosynthetic manu-
factures, project regulators, con-
tractors and academics through 
discussion about the main geo-
synthetics themes, which com-
prises keynote lectures, paper 
presentations and debates. 

• an overview of new technologies 
and innovations, by offering a 
large forum to engineers and re-
searchers. 

The conference will be conducted at 
high scientific and technical levels, 
and will present applications infor-
mation to match the expectations of 
all participants. 

Technical Program 
The conference will highlight the 
MAIN topics in the geosynthetic 

industry and applications. The tradi-
tional Giroud Lecture will be deliv-
ered in a special session. Keynote 
lectures and selected papers will be 
presented on the main themes, 
which are: 
• Case Histories 
• Design Approaches and Numeri-

cal Solutions 
• Drainage and Filtration 
• Durability and Long Term Per-

formance 
• Geosynthetics in Agriculture and 

Aquaculture 
• Geosynthetics in Dynamic Appli-

cations  
• Geosynthetics in Environmental 

Applications  
• Geosynthetics in Highways and 

Railways 
• Geosynthetics in Hydraulic Appli-

cations  
• Geosynthetics in Mining Applica-

tions  

mailto:lesley@cebisaconferences.co.za�
http://www.geoafrica2009.org/�
mailto:lesley@cebisaconferences.co.za�
http://www.gigsa.org/�
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• Geosynthetics Properties 
• Innovative Uses and Solutions 
• New Geosynthetic Products 
• Reinforced Walls and Slopes 
• Reinforcement of Embankments 

and Unpaved Roads 
• Soil-Geosynthetic Interaction 

Call for Abstracts 
Papers may cover any of the sub-
jects described in the Technical 
Program above and the abstracts 
are limited to 500 words. According 
to the regulations by the Interna-
tional Geosynthetics Society, an 
author can have only one paper with 
his name as the 1st author (no limit 
for papers as co-author). In addition, 
chapters of the IGS can submit up to 
10 papers on “Case Histories of 
Geosynthetics Engineering Prac-
tice” in addition to submissions from 
individuals. 

Abstracts from individuals shall 
be uploaded  

before 30 October 2008 

Abstracts from IGS Chapters 
shall be uploaded  

before 28 February 2009. 

Selection of Abstracts 
All the submitted abstracts will be 
reviewed by the International Paper 

Selection Committee of invited in-
ternational experts on all subjects 
covered by the Conference. The 
abstracts must be sufficiently de-
tailed to allow the experts to evalu-
ate the scientific and technical con-
tents of the proposed paper, espe-
cially the relevance of the results 
obtained and the contribution they 
make towards advances in the ap-
plication of geosynthetics. Papers 
must be original and must not be of 
commercial nature. 

Exhibition 
An International Exhibition will be 
opened to the conference delegates 
and visitors to show the latest 
technological innovations and ser-
vices provided by the geosynthetics 
industry. The conference venue has 
outstanding exhibition facilities, with 
2,000 m2 of available space for 
about eighty exhibitors (manufac-
turers, laboratories, consultants, 
contractors, suppliers, installers, 
agencies, project offices, and all 
organizations related to geosyn-
thetics). Detailed information for 
both the 9IGC and the international 
exhibition will be available after May, 
1st, 2008, at the conference website: 
www.9icg-brazil2010.info 

 

Venue 
The 9ICG will be held at Sofitel Je-
quitimar Hotel in Guarujá, Brazil. 
Guarujá is a beautiful coastal town 
about 90km from the city of Sao 
Paulo, which is the biggest me-
tropolis in South America and offers 
a large variety of cultural, touristic 
and gastronomic attractions. 

Language 
English will be the official language 
of the Conference. 

Important Deadlines 
Abstracts submission:  
October 30th 2008 
Acceptance of abstracts:   
November 30th 2008 
Papers submission for individuals:  
May 31st 2009 
Papers submission for IGS Chap-
ters: July 31st 2009 

Conference Secretariat 
9ICG - Brazil 2010 
Av. Brigadeiro Faria Lima, 1478 sala 
314, São Paulo, SP, 
01451-001, Brazil. 
Tel.:  + 55 11 3032 3399 
Fax:  + 55 11 3819 6311 
E-mail: info@9icg-brazil2010.info 
website: www.9icg-brazil2010.info 

 

News from the IGS Chapters 
 

David J. Elton Assumes Presidency of 
North American Geosynthetics Society (NAGS) 

 
Dr. David J. Elton, P.E., became 
President of the North American 
Geosynthetics Society (NAGS) at 
the biennial meeting of NAGS held 
during the 1st Pan American Geo-
synthetics Conference in Cancun, 
Mexico. Dr. Elton received the office 
from Dr. Grace Hsuan, who served 
as President of the organization for 
two years. 

Dr. Elton is a professor of Civil En-
gineering at Auburn University, in 
Auburn, AL, specializing in geosyn-
thetics and geotechnical engineer-
ing. Dr. Elton teaches courses in 
geosynthetics, landfills and earth 
structures involving geosynthetics. 
He organized and taught at each of 
the five yearly Industrial Fabrics 
Association International / National 

Science Foundation Professor 
Training Courses for Geosynthetics.  
NAGS provides leadership in ad-
vancing the education and research 
of geosynthetics through confer-
ences, short courses, research 
sponsorship and information dis-
persal. NAGS has 200 members in 
the US and Canada, and is the 
oldest and largest chapter of the 
International Geosynthetics Society. 

http://www.9icg-brazil2010.info/�
mailto:info@9icg-brazil2010.info�
http://www.9icg-brazil2010.info/�
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Dr. Elton, as presi-
dent, is joined by 
Dean Sandri, presi-
dent - elect, Robert 
Mackey, treasurer, 
and L. David Suits, 
executive director. 
Dr. Hsuan assumes 
the role of Immedi-
ate Past President. 
A board of seven 
vice presidents com-
pletes the organiza-
tion. 
North American 
Geosynthetics Soci-
ety is the U.S. and 
Canadian Chapter of 
the International 
Geosynthetics Soci-
ety. 
NAGS offers many 
benefits to members, 
including 
• Membership in the 

International Geosynthetics Soci-
ety. 

• Free on-line subscriptions to 
“Geotextiles and Geomem-
branes,” and “Geosynthetics In-
ternational” Journals; including 
access to all back issues. 

• New members: free one year 
subscription to Geosynthetics,” 
magazine, formerly known as 
GFR, the industry trade magazine. 

• Reduced subscription rate to 
“Geosynthetics” after the first year 
free subscription for North Ameri-
can Members. 

• Reduced registration rates to In-
ternational and Regional Geo-
synthetics Conferences and 
Seminars. 

 
More information is at  
www.nags-igs.org.  
 

 

GIGSA – The South African Chapter of the IGS 
President’s Report, June 2008 

 
In late November 2006 the two year 
term of office for me, Garth James, 
as President of GIGSA started, tak-
ing over the function from the out-
going President Peter Legg. Many 
thanks for his support and his self-
less attitude shown during his ten-
ure. He certainly has set a good 
example and left me with a hard act 
to follow. GIGSA is fortunate to have 
a very strong committee comprising 
experienced members as well as 
energetic new blood to keep eve-
ryone on their toes. Their hard work 
in amongst their busy schedules is 
greatly appreciated. 
GIGSA’s main goals for the period 
2007-2008 are simple: 
• Improve communication with, and 

service delivery to, our members 
• Raise the profile of GIGSA as a 

respected society 
• Establish regular training pro-

grammes and seminars on geo-
synthetics 

• Strengthen relationships with af-
filiated and allied societies and in-
stitutions 

South Africa is experiencing boom 
times in Civil Engineering Construc-
tion prompted by the multi-billion 
Rand projects for the Gautrain 
Rapid Rail-link and the 2010 

FIFA-World Cup. The geosynthetic 
prospects are great as a result. 
Many questions have been raised 
as to whether South Africa will be 
able to deliver on the 2010 
FIFA-World Cup. Five new stadiums 
are being built and many others 
refurbished for this prestigious event. 
At the last FIFA inspection the pro-
gress was well on track and the lit-

mus test comes next June when 
South Africa hosts the 2009 Con-
federations Cup. 
The role that geosynthetics play in 
the speedy delivery of such struc-
tures can be significant and they are 
being used. 

 

 

photo credit: R. Holtz

 
Newly installed President, Dr. Elton (r), receives the honorary 
gavel from departing NAGS President Dr. Hsuan. 

 

 
Piet Meyer (representing Aquatan, received the Construction Award), Kelvin Legge (to-
gether with Aquatan received the Development in Technology Award), Garth James (cur-
rent GIGSA President), Anton Bain (representing the GIGSA Awards Committee) (left to 
right) 

http://www.nags-igs.org/�


 
IGS News, Vol. 24, No. 2, July 2008   15 

Events 
GIGSA conducted a series of re-
ports around the country during May 
2007 on the 8th International Con-
ference held in September 2006. 
Reporting on international trends 
and interesting applications and 
research into geosynthetics involv-
ing 351 technical papers and case 
studies as well as three keynote and 
one Special Giroud lecture was a 
challenging task but it was one that 
Danie Brink, Peter Legg and myself 
took seriously to enable us to give 
our members and geosynthetic 
friends a comprehensive report in as 
concise a way as possible. The re-
ports in Durban, Cape Town and 
Gauteng were well received and 
well attended. 
Five of our fellow country men were 
fortunate enough to attend a training 
seminar in Würzburg, Germany in 
April 2007 on the Long term per-
formance of geosynthetics. 
For the past few years a series of 
seminars titled “How Safe is that 
Concrete Retaining Block Wall?” 
have been held in different cities of 
South Africa. Run by the Concrete 
Manufacturers Association (CMA) 
the focus has been on “Design As-
pects” and Geosynthetics with re-
spect to “Polymers, products, prop-
erties and their behaviour” in flexible 
concrete retaining block walls. As a 
service to its members and any in-
terested and affected parties, the 
CMA has put a lot of effort into 
making sure that specifiers and in-
stallers are given the correct guide-
lines and procedures for the design 
and construction of safe concrete 
retaining block walls. GIGSA is for-
tunate to have been involved with 
two of the presentations being made 
by one of our Past Presidents, Alan 
Parrock, and myself. The role of the 
contractor is also part of the pro-
gramme in these seminars. 
GIGSA endeavours to do the same 
to keep its members and the indus-
try in general informed on devel-
opments in geosynthetics as well as 
making a contribution to events in-
volved in the education of individu-
als in this field through visiting ex-
perts from overseas. 
One such event was the Landfill 
2007 Seminar held at Misty Hills, 

Muldersdrift in Gauteng, South Af-
rica, from 12-14 September. This 
successful seminar was co-hosted 
by the GIGSA and the Institute of 
Waste Management of South Af-
rica.We were pleased to have Dr. 
Abdelmalek Bouazza of Monash 
University, Melbourne, Australia, 
delivering a keynote address on 
“Recent advances in GCL research 
and relevance to landfill liners de-
sign”. As part of the seminar he also 
ran a short course on GCLs as part 
of the Seminar at the Cradle of 
Humankind at Maropeng, not too far 
from the Landfill 2007 venue.  
The GIGSA used the opportunity to 
make their 2006 awards and we 
congratulate the following deserving 
recipients: 
• Development in Technology - 

Kelvin Legge and Aquatan (Pty) 
Ltd for the development of a sys-
tem that mitigates the negative 
effects of heat on geosynthetic 
materials in barrier systems. 

• Construction - Aquatan (Pty) 
Ltd for the Geomembrane Lining 
System to the Effluent Treatment 
Plant at Mondi in Richards Bay. 

A series of reports on GeoAmericas 
2008 and EuroGeo 2008 by South 
African delegates to these confer-
ences is planned for late November 
2008 in the three main centres of 
South Africa, namely, Johannesburg, 
Cape Town and Durban. 

Specifications and Guidelines 
The GIGSA continues to work on 
generating specification guideline 
documents on the application of 
Geosynthetics in the different civil 
engineering disciplines, inter alia: 
• The SANS 207 Code of Practice 

on Reinforcing Soils and Fills us-
ing Geosynthetics (based on BS 
8006) is available through the 
South African National Standards 
authority (SANS). A series of 
workshops on this document is 
planned for early 2009. 

• “Asphalt Reinforcement Guide-
lines” is a draft document under 
the auspices of the Road Pave-
ment Forum. It was included as a 
draft in the proceedings of the 
Committee on Asphaltic Pave-
ments of Southern Africa 
(CAPSA) 2007 Conference which 

took place in Gaborone, Botswana, 
in September 2007. The contents 
of this document were the subject 
of a series of workshops through 
the Society for Asphalt Technol-
ogy (SAT) in KZN, Gauteng and 
Cape Town to get support and 
feedback from the road pavement 
and surfacing industry. This 
Guideline document has now 
been completed and will be pub-
lished as an Asphalt Academy 
document in the second half of 
2008. 

• The GCL specification guideline 
drafted by a GIGSA technical 
sub-committee is being finalised 
and will be the subject of a series 
of workshops in the main cities of 
South Africa in late August 2008. 

GeoAfrica 2009 
The GIGSA was encouraged by the 
IGS Council (Daniele Cazzuffi) to 
host the first African Geosynthetic 
Regional Conference and we as a 
committee have accepted the chal-
lenge. The conference, known as 
GeoAfrica 2009, will be held at the 
Cape Sun Hotel in Cape Town from 
2-5 September 2009. 
A GIGSA sub-committee has been 
formed under the Chairmanship of 
Peter Legg to facilitate the planning 
of this conference along with a pro-
fessional conference organiser. The 
first announcement has been circu-
lated and publicised at GeoAmeri-
cas in Cancun earlier this year as 
well as at Geosynthetics Asia in 
Shanghai last month. The same will 
be done at EuroGeo4 in Edinburgh 
in September. The call for abstracts 
has been distributed and posted on 
the web site. You can visit the web-
site for more details and information 
at: www.geoafrica2009.org 
The GIGSA is very excited to be 
hosting this prestigious event and 
we do not underestimate the task at 
hand. We will gratefully accept any 
help we can get.  
We hope to see you all at GeoAfrica 
2009! 
 
Reported by 
Garth James, President GIGSA 
 

 

http://www.geoafrica2009.org/�
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IGS Norwegian Chapter finally formed! 
 

NORGENORGENORGENORGE
 

The IGS Norwegian Chapter was 
finally formed in May 2008, the by-
laws and the constituted board of 
the Norwegian chapter were ap-
proved by IGS council in their 
meeting in Cancun in Mexico in 
March 2008. It has been a long and 
winding road to achieve this! The 
original plan was to form a Nordic 
chapter including members in all the 
Nordic countries and this is origi-
nating back to 1999 and an invita-
tion to ask for possible interest in 
forming a Nordic chapter was sent 
out in 2001. However it turned out to 
be very difficult to find a good way of 
organising a chapter including sev-
eral countries and based on a clear 
advice from IGS it was decided to 
go for a national chapter in Norway 
in 2007, so after 8 years the chapter 
is finally up and running! The chap-
ter is also open for participants from 
the other Nordic countries if no na-
tional chapter is formed. 
The first meeting in the Norwegian 
chapter was held in Oslo 
2008-06-04 and the constituted 

board was approved by the mem-
bers. The board consists of: 
• Arnstein Watn, SINTEF. President 
• Per K. Hoel, Terratec. Vice Pre-

sident 
• Hanne Louise Moe, SINTEF. 

Secretary 
• Henning Sørensen, Ahlsell. 

Treasurer 
• Roald Aabøe, Norwegian Direc-

torate of Roads. Board member 
 
The board will work closely together 
with the geosynthetic committee of 
the Norwegian Geotechnical Society 
(NGF) and the board members 
Hanne Louise Moe and Roald 

Aabøe are also members of NGF 
Geosynthetic committee. 
The chapter plans to arrange for a 
common travel arrangement to Eu-
roGeo 4. It is also responsible to-
gether with NGF Geosynthetic 
committee for arranging a geosyn-
thetic session at the Nordic Geo-
technical meeting in Norway in Sep-
tember 2008. It will also work on 
establishing a web-based geosyn-
thetic guide together with NGF 
Geosynthetic committee. 
 
Reported by 
Arnstein Watn, IGS Norwegian 
Chapter President 
 

 

Former Vice-chairman of German IGS Chapter  
Dr. Wilmers received EMS-award 

 
During the celebration of the jubilee 
due to the 15 year existence of the 
"Institut für textile Bau- and Um-
welttechnik GmbH (tBU)", Greven, 
Dr. Wilhelm Wilmers received the 
"EMS" award from Prof. Müller--
Rochholz, head of tBU. The award 
is founded by the "Fundraising 
Group of tBU e.V". endowed with 
2500 EUR. With the award works 
and activities in development ("E" 
for the German word: "Entwick-
lung"), material innovation ("M") and 
security ("S") in the field of textile 
constructions and environmental 
engineering are honoured. 
Dr. Wilmers is the first laureate and 
is honoured for his engagement for 

the use of geosynthetics in road 
constructions for decades. Dr. 
Wilmers started in 1976 with test 
sections for determining the behav-
iour of nonwovens as separation 
layers between weak and low bear-
ing subsoils and granular subbase 
materials. He was head of the 
working group AA 5.15 of the "For-
schungsgesellschaft für Straßen- 
und Verkehrswesen e.V. (FGSV)" 
that was also a working group (AK 
5.3) of the special section "Geo-
synthetics in Geotechnics" of the 
German Geotechnical Society 
(DGGT). Since the foundation of this 
special section and of the German 
Chapter of the International Geo-

synthetics Society (IGS) Dr. Wilmers 
was vice-chairman of both organi-
sations until 2005. So he was and is 
still active in the field of geosyn-
thetics application and research 
even after retiring in 1999 from his 
work at the road administration of 
the German federal state Hessen. 
Due to his enormous personal ef-
forts geosynthetics are well known 
and used in all fields of road con-
structions covered with a funda-
mental set of recommendations 
developed under his leadership. 

 
      Board of IGS Norwegain Chapter (from left to right): 
      Henning Sørensen, Hanne Louise Moe, Arnstein Watn, Per K. Hoel 
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Dr. Wilmers (middle) received the EMS--
Award from Prof. Müller-Rochholz (right) and 
the mayor of Greven Mr. Vennemayer 

The merits of Dr. Wilmers were 
shown in laudation and lectures on 
geosynthetics and earthwork spe-
cific topics given by Mr. Roderich 
Hillmann (Federal Highway Re-
search Institute - BASt), IGS mem-
bers Jochen Müller-Rochholz and 
Prof. Georg Heerten and IGS 
Council member Gerhard Bräu. The 
main lecture on geosynthetics his-
tory and progress was given by Dr. 
Wilmers himself. He showed the 
efficiency of geosynthetics, the pro-
gress in research and application 
over the years and the potential of 
geosynthetics in saving raw materi-
als, resources and costs during 
construction of roads and at main-

tenance. The same efforts he spent 
on the development of recommen-
dations and standards for quality 
assurance and testing of geosyn-
thetics on national and international 
level within CEN and ISO groups. 
All speakers and attendees of the 
ceremony expressed to Dr. Wilmers 
their thanks and recognition and the 
best wishes for his further path of 
life in the best of health. 
 
reported by  
Georg Heerten and  
Gerhard Bräu, vice-chairmen of 
German IGS Chapter 
 

List of IGS Chapters and their Chairpersons 
 
Australia 

Australasian Chapter (2002) 
President: Mr. Mike Sadlier 
sadlier@attglobal.net  

Belgium 
Belgian Chapter (2001),  
Chairman: Frans De Meerleer,  
frans.texion@skynet.be 
toon.deruyver@copro.eu 
www.belgian-geosynthetics.be/  

Brazil 
Brazilian Chapter (1997) 
President: Prof. Mauricio Ehrlich 
igsbrasil@igsbrasil.org.br 
www.igsbrasil.org.br 

Chile 
Chilean Chapter (2006),  
President: Mr. Mauricio Ossa,  
mossa@igs-chile.org 
http://igs-chile.org/index.html 

China 
Chinese Chapter (1990) 
Chairman: Li, Guangxin 
postmaster@ccigs.com.cn 
www.ccigs.com.cn 

Czech Republic 
Czech Chapter (2003) 
Chairman: Mr. Petr Hubik 
info@igs.cz 

France 
French Chapter (1993) 
President: Mr. Jean-Pierre Magnan 
Francois.caquel@equipement.gouv.fr  

Germany 
German Chapter (1993) 
Chairman: Prof. Dr.-Ing. Martin Ziegler 
service@dggt.de 
www.gb.bv.tum.de/fachsektion/index.htm 

Greece 
HGS, Greek Chapter (2005) 
President: Mr. Dimitrios K. Atmatzidis 
dac@upatras.gr 

India 
Indian Chapter (1988) 
President: Dr. G.V. Rao 
cbip@cbip.org 
www.cbip.org 

Indonesia 
INA-IGS, the Indonesian Chapter (1992) 

President: Mr. Gouw Tjie Liong 
ina_igs@binus.ac.id 

Italy 
AGI-IGS, the Italian Chapter (1992) 
President: Dr. Ing. Daniele Cazzuffi 
agiroma@iol.it  
www.associazionegeotecnica.it/~agi/ 

Japan 
Japanese Chapter (1985) 
Chairman: Dr. Hiroshi Miki 
secret$jcigs.or$g 
wwwsoc.nii.ac.jp/jcigs/ 

Korea 
KC-IGS, The Korean Chapter (1993) 
President: Dr. Sam-Deok Cho 
yusung@chonbuk.ac.kr 
www.kgss.or.kr/ 

Mexico 
Mexican Chapter (2006) 
President: Giovanni Bellei 
IGSmexico@prodigy.net.mx 

The Netherlands 
Netherlands Chapter (1992) 
President: Dr. Ir. A. H. de Bondt 
mail@ngo.nl 
www.ngo.nl/  

North America 
North American Geosynthetics Society 
(NAGS) (Canada, USA) (1986) 
President: Dr.David Elton 
NagsDirector@aol.com 
www.nags-igs.org 

Norway 
Norwegian Chapter of IGS (2008) 
Chairman: Arnstein Watn 
Arnstein.watn@sintef.no 

Peru 
Peruvian Chapter (2001) 
President: Miguel De La Torre 
gerencia@geoserviceing.com 
www.igsperu.org 

Philippines 
Philippine Chapter (2007) 
President: Engr. Emil Morales 
pnjavier@hotmail.com 
www.igsphilippines.com 

Portugal 
Portuguese Chapter (2003) 
President: Maria de Lurdes Lopes 

Lcosta@fe.up.pt 
Romania 

Romanian Chapter (1996) 
President: Dr. Valentin Feodorov 
loretta@mail.utcb.ro 

Russia 
Russian chapter of IGS (RCIGS, 2008) 
President: Prof. Andrey Ponomaryov 
ofrikhter@permonline.ru 

South Africa 
South African Chapter (1995) 
President: Garth James 
geotexgp@iafrica.com 
www.gigsa.org 

Singapore, Malaysia and Brunei 
South-East Asian Chapter (1988) 
President: Dr. Chew Soon Hoe 
indrayogan@bbr-singapore.com.sg 

Spain 
Spanish Chapter (1999) 
President: Mr. Angel Leiro 
pabad@cetco.es 
www.igs-espana.com 

Thailand 
Thai Chapter (2002) 
President: Prof. Dennes T. Bergado 
bergado@ait.ac.th 
www.set.ait.ac.th/acsig/igs-thailand 

Turkey 
Turkish Chapter (2001) 
President: Prof. Fazil Erol Guler 
eguler@boun.edu.tr 

United Kingdom 
U.K. Chapter (1987) 
Chairman: Russell Jones 
petera@huesker.co.uk 
www.igs-uk.org 

West Pacific R. Chapter 
West Pacific Regional Chapter (1997) 
President: Dr. Rong-Her Chen 
ttateh@cycu.edu.tw 

 
Note: 
• In case of not updated information, 

the IGS chapters are invited to 
notify to both IGS Secretary and 
IGS News Editor 
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Official Journals of the IGS 
 

Electronic Journals Free to IGS Members 
 
 

Geosynthetics International 
 

 
Geosynthetics International is an 
official journal of the IGS and has 
established itself as a premier 
peer-reviewed journal on geosyn-
thetics. The Journal publishes tech-
nical papers, technical notes, dis-
cussions, and book reviews on all 
topics relating to geosynthetic ma-
terials (including natural fiber prod-
ucts), research, behaviour, per-
formance analysis, testing, design, 
construction methods, case histo-
ries, and field experience. 
Geosynthetics International is only 
published electronically starting 
Volume 10 (2003) by Thomas Tel-
ford and is free to IGS Members. All 

others, e.g., corporations, compa-
nies, and university libraries, can 
subscribe at a rate of £ 421 / 
US$ 870. An individual rate for 
those non-members whose organi-
zation subscribes, but would like an 
additional personal subscription 
(including the update CD) will be 
available for £ 60 / US$ 108. 
The update CD is issued annually 
as part of the subscription for non- 
IGS Members and includes all pa-
pers published in that year. IGS 
Members can opt to buy the CD for 
US$100. 
Visit the Journal’s web site given 
below for subscription information 
and instructions for accessing the 
latest issues. 
Papers should be work not pub-
lished in full elsewhere and should 
be sent to one of the following indi-
viduals: 
Professor R.J. Bathurst, Editor 
Geosynthetics International 
Department of Civil Engineering 
Royal Military College of Canada 

P.O. Box 17000, STN Forces King-
ston, Ontario K7K 7B4, Canada 
Tel: 1/613 541 6000, Ext. 6479 
Fax: 1/613 541 6218 
E-mail: bathurst-r@rmc.ca 
 
Dr. J.P. Giroud, Chair Geosynthet-
ics International  
J.P. Giroud, IC.  
5837 North Ocean Boulevard 
Ocean Ridge, Florida 33435, USA  
Tel: 1/561 737 1642  
Fax: 1/561 733 2809 
E-mail: jpg@jpgiroud.com 
 
For subscription details visit the 
Journal’s web site at: 
www.thomastelford.com/geosynthet
ics or contact:  
Maria Davis  
Thomas Telford Ltd  
1 Heron Quay  
London E14 4JD, UK 
Tel: 44/20 7665 2460  
Fax: 44/20 7538 9620 
maria.davis@thomastelford.com 

 
Content of Volume: 15, Issue: 2 (2008) 

Compaction effects on strains within 
profiled thermoplastic pipes 
R. W. I. Brachman, I. D. Moore and 
S. M. Munro 
View Header/Abstract 
Measurement of geotextile–water 
characteristic curve using capillary 
rise principle 
H. Krisdani, H. Rahardjo and E.-C. 
Leong 
View Header/Abstract 
The effect of fine soil content on the 
filtration characteristics of geotextile 
under cyclic flows 
R.-H. Chen, C.-C. Ho and C.-Y. Hsu 
View Header/Abstract 

Seismic stability of reinforced 
slopes: effects of reinforcement 
properties and facing rigidity 
C.-C. Huang, J.-C. Horng and J.-J. 
Charng 
View Header/Abstract 
Shear strength and deformation 
characteristics of geosynthetic soil 
bags stacked horizontal and inclined 
K. Matsushima, U. Aqil, Y. Mohri 
and F. Tatsuoka 
View Header/Abstract 
Leachate chemical composition ef-
fects on OIT depletion in an HDPE 
geomembrane 

R. K. Rowe, M. Z. Islam and Y. G. 
Hsuan 
View Header/Abstract 
Buckling experiments on polyethyl-
ene liners with egg-shaped 
cross-sections 
B. Falter, J. Müller-Rochholz, J. Ei-
lers and M. Gutermann 
View Header/Abstract 
Overall slope stability of prestressed 
geosynthetic-reinforced embank-
ments on soft ground 
S. K. Shukla and R. Kumar 
View Header/Abstract 
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Content of Volume: 15, Issue: 3 (2008) 
Foreword 
Abdelmalek Bouazza 
View Header/Abstract 
The application of geotextile and 
granular filters for PCB remediation 
I. Kalinovich, A. Rutter, R. K. Rowe, 
R. McWatters and J. S. Poland 
View Header/Abstract 
Dewatering of oily slurry using dry-
ing bed with geotextile filter 
M. B. Mendonça, M. Ehrlich, M. C. 
Cammarota and D. D. C. Freire 

View Header/Abstract 
Treatment of lagooned sewage 
sludge in situ using electrokinetic 
geosynthetics 
S. Glendinning, J. Lamont-Black, C. 
J. F. P. Jones and J. Hall 
View Header/Abstract 
Performance modeling and optimi-
zation of contaminant extraction 
using prefabricated vertical wells 
(PVWs) 

N. Sharmin, T. Kunberger, M. A. 
Gabr, J. D. Quaranta and J. J. 
Bowders 
View Header/Abstract 
Numerical evaluation of prefabri-
cated vertical drain enhanced soil 
vapour extraction system 
H. Abuel-Naga, A. Bouazza, J. 
Bowders and O. Collazos 
View Header/Abstract 
 

 

Geotextiles & Geomembranes 
 

 
Geotextiles and Geomembranes is 
dedicated to the mission of the IGS, 
which is to promote the scientific 
and engineering development of 
geotextiles, geomembranes, related 
products, and associated technolo-
gies. 
The Journal publishes technical 
papers, technical notes, discussions, 
and book reviews on all topics re-
lating to geosynthetics, research, 
behaviour, performance analysis, 
testing, design, construction meth-
ods, case histories, and field ex-
perience. 
Papers should be submitted elec-
tronically as a Microsoft Word or pdf 
file to: kerry@civil.queensu.ca 

Please ensure the text is double 
spaced, there is an abstract with 
keywords included, and tables and 
figures are at the end following the 
text. Please check the Journal’s 
instructions for authors for additional 
information regarding submissions. 
The Journal strives to provide the 
authors with quick, constructive re-
views, and we appreciate the au-
thor’s hard work in addressing these 
comments and quick return of re-
vised papers. 
Geotextiles and Geomembranes is 
now available free in electronic 
format to IGS Members. To activate 
free access and to create your per-
sonal account, you will need your 
IGS Membership Number. If you do 
not know your Membership Number, 
please contact the IGS Secretariat 
at IGSsec@aol.com. 
For instructions on how to activate 
access and create your personal 
account, go the web site provided 
below. 
A hardcopy of Geotextiles and 
Geomembranes is available at a 

reduced subscription rate to indi-
vidual and Corporate Members of 
the IGS. Individual IGS Members 
may subscribe at an 84% discount: 
US$170 for six issues. IGS Corpo-
rate Members may subscribe at a 
64% discount: US$396 for six is-
sues. Please indicate that you are 
an IGS Member when requesting 
the special price. 
 
For editorial enquiries contact:  
Dr. R. Kerry Rowe, Editor Geotex-
tiles and Geomembranes  
Dept. of Civil Engineering Ellis Hall, 
Queens University Kingston, 
Ontario K7L 3N6 CANADA  
Fax: 1/613 533 6934  
E-mail: kerry@civil.queensu.ca 
 
For more information on obtaining 
electronic and hard copy subscrip-
tions to Geotextiles and Geomem-
branes please go to the following 
IGS web site:  
www.geosyntheticssociety.org/ 
 

 
Content of Volume 26, Issue 3 (June 2008) 

A study on biological clogging of 
nonwoven geotextiles under 
leachate flow 
Ennio M. Palmeira, Aline F.N. Re-
migio, Maria L.G. Ramos, Ricardo S. 
Bernardes 
Abstract/Paper 
Preloading clayey deposit by vac-
uum pressure with cap-drain: 
Analyses versus performance 
Jinchun Chai, Norihiko Miura, D.T. 
Bergado 
Abstract/Paper 
Model studies on geogrid- or geo-
cell-reinforced sand cushion on soft 

soil 
Huabao Zhou, Xuejun Wen 
Abstract/Paper 
Combined effect of PVDs and rein-
forcement on embankments over 
rate-sensitive soils 
R. Kerry Rowe, C. Taechakumthorn 
Abstract/Paper 
The influence of uniaxial tensile 
strain on the pore size and filtration 
characteristics of geotextiles 
Cho-Sen Wu, Yung-Shan Hong, 
Ruei-Hung Wang 
Abstract/Paper 

Evaluating the effects of the magni-
tude and amplification of 
pseudo-static acceleration on rein-
forced soil slopes and walls using 
the limit equilibrium Horizontal 
Slices Method 
H. Nouri, A. Fakher, C.J.F.P. Jones 
Abstract/Paper 
Earth reinforcement using soilbags 
Yongfu Xu, Jian Huang, Yanjun Du, 
De’an Sun 
Abstract/Paper 
Corrigendum to “Experimental and 
theoretical investigation of strength 
of soil reinforced with multi-layer 
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horizontal–vertical orthogonal ele-
ments” [Geotextiles Geomembranes 
26 (2008) 1–13] 

M.X. Zhang, H. Zhou, A.A. Javadi, 
Z.W. Wang 
Abstract/Paper 

 
Content of Volume 26, Issue 4 (August 2008) 

Pseudo-dynamic approach of seis-
mic design for waterfront reinforced 
soil-wall 
Syed Mohd. Ahmad, Deepankar 
Choudhury 
Abstract/Paper 
The behavior of a laminated rein-
forced granular column 
Cho-Sen Wu, Yung-Shan Hong 
Abstract/Paper 
Effects of viscous behavior of geo-
synthetic reinforcement and founda-
tion soils on the performance of re-

inforced embankments 
Allen Lunzhu Li, R. Kerry Rowe 
Abstract/Paper 
Seismic response of reinforced soil 
retaining wall models: Influence of 
backfill relative density 
G. Madhavi Latha, A. Murali Krishna 
Abstract/Paper 
New seismic parameters in the 
analysis of retaining walls with rein-
forced backfill 
S. Shekarian, A. Ghanbari, A. 
Farhadi 

Abstract/Paper 
On the interface shear resistance of 
a novel geogrid with in-plane 
drainage capability 
Brendan C. O’Kelly, Patrick J. 
Naughton 
Abstract/Paper 
Investigation on failure of a geo-
synthetic lined reservoir 
W. Wu, X.T. Wang, F. Aschauer 
Abstract/Paper 

 
 

Geotextiles and Geomembranes: Best papers in 2007 
by Kerry Rowe 

 
Geotextiles and Geomembranes is 
an Official Journal of the IGS, and 
IGS members get free access to 
papers published in the journal 
since 1995. It is one of the highest 
impact journals in geotechnical en-
gineering and one of two primary 
archival outlets for papers published 
on geosynthetics. It enjoys an ex-
cellent flow of high quality papers. 
Following the Editorial Board meet-
ing held in Yokohama in September 
2006 it was decided that it would be 
desirable to recognise some of the 
best papers published in Geotextiles 
and Geomembranes. We started 
with Volume 23 and the winners for 
2005 and 2006 were celebrated at 
the GeoAmericas 2008 Conference 
in Cancun in March 2008. The Edi-
torial Board was then charged with 
selecting what they considered to be 
the “Best Paper” published in Geo-
textiles and Geomembranes in 
Volume 25, 2007. Papers were 
considered for their contribution to 
the discipline in terms of providing 
significant new insights and/or of 

being of high potential impact on the 
discipline. All Technical Articles ex-
cept those co-authored by the Editor 
were eligible. The winners were 
selected based solely on a vote of 
the Editorial Board members. 
Following a rigorous review of the 
papers I am pleased to announce 
that the Best Paper for 2007 was: 
• Effect of deformations on the hy-

draulic stability of coastal struc-
tures made of geotextile sand 
containers  
by Juan Recio and Hocine 
Oumeraci, Geotextiles and Geo-
membranes, 25(4-5): 278-292. 

Three papers were selected for 
Honourable Mention  
• Tension in geomembranes on 

landfill slopes under static and 
earthquake loading—Centrifuge 
study  
by N.I. Thusyanthan, S.P.G. 
Madabhushi and S. Singh , Geo-
textiles and Geomembranes, 
25(2): 78-95. 

• Geosynthetic reinforcement for 
the reduction of the effects of ex-

plosions of internally pressurised 
buried pipes  
by N. Tupa and E.M. Palmeira 
Geotextiles and Geomembranes, 
25(2): 109-127. 

• Remedial treatment of soil struc-
tures using geosyn-
thetic-reinforcing technology  
by F. Tatsuoka, M. Tateyama, Y. 
Mohri and K. Matsushima, Geo-
textiles and Geomembranes, 
25(4-5): 204-220. 

 
As runners-up and hence being 
judged to be amongst the four best 
papers published in Geotextiles and 
Geomembranes in 2007. Con-
gratulations to all of the authors for 
their very significant contribution to 
the geosynthetics discipline. 
 
R. Kerry Rowe 
Editor 
Geotextiles and Geomembranes 
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Conferences 
 
Symposia 
 
Workshops 

Calendar of Events 

 

Short Courses

Expositions

Trade Shows
 
 
6th International Conference on Case 
Histories in Geotechnical Engineering 
Washington, D.C., USA 
11 - 16 August 2008 
E-mail: prakash@umr.edu 
www.6icchge2008.org 

1st International Conference on Trans-
portation Geotechnics 
Nottingham, United Kingdom 
25 - 27 August 2008 
E-mail: 
geomechanics@nottingham.ac.uk 
www.nottingham.ac.uk/ncg 

19th European Young Geotechnical En-
gineers Conference 
Gyor, Hungary 
4 - 5 September 2008 
E-mail: issmge@ymmfk.szie.hu; 
imreemok@hotmail.com 

Global Waste Management Symposium 
Copper, Colorado, USA 
7 - 10 September 2008 
E-mail: rita.ugianskis@penton.com 
www.wastesymposium.com 

5th Bored and Auger Piles Conference 
8 - 10 September 2008 
Ghent, Belgium 
E-mail: william.vanimpe@ugent.be 

Stress Wave 2008 - 8th International 
Conference on the Application of Stress 
Wave Theory to Piles 
Lisbon, Portugal 
8 - 10 September 2008 
E-mail: sw2008@civil.ist.utl.pt 
www.civil.ist.utl.pt/sw2008 

EuroGeo4 
The Fourth European  
Geosynthetics Conference 
Edinburgh, Scotland, UK 
7 - 10 September 2008 
E-mail: eurogeo4@eurogeo4.org 
www.eurogeo4.org 

11th Baltic Sea Geotechnical Confer-
ence - Geotechnics in Maritime Engi-
neering, Gdansk, Poland 
15 - 18 September 2008 
E-mail: BC11@pg.gda.pl 
www.pg.gda.pl/~BC11 

Waste 2008 
Stratford-upon-Avon, Warwickshire, 
England 
16 - 17 September 2008  

Email: info@waste2008.com 
www.waste2008.com 

4th International Symposium on Defor-
mation Characteristics of Geomaterials  
Atlanta, Georgia 
22 - 24 September 2008 
E-mail: webmaster@isatlanta2008.org 
www.isatlanta2008.org 

2nd Remediation Technologies Expo 
RemTech 2008 
Ferrara, Italy 
24 - 26 September 2008 
Email: info@ferrarafiere.it 
www.remtechexpo.com 

30th Baugrundtagung 
Dortmund, Germany 
24 - 27 September 2008 
Email: service@dggt.de 
www.baugrundtagung.com 

First International Conference on Haz-
ardous Waste Management 
Chania-Crete, Greece 
1 - 3 October 2008 
E-mail:  
hwm1.conference@ enveng.tuc.gr 
www.hwm1.tuc.gr 

12th International Conference of the 
IACMAG 
Goa, India 
1 - 6 October 2008 
E-mail: dns@civil.iitb.ac.in 
www.civil.iitb.ac.in/~dns 

XXI National Conference on  
Geosynthetics 
Bologna, Italy 
15 October 2008 
E-mail: agiroma@iol.it 

NUCGE'08  
Skikda, Algeria  
27 - 29 October 2008  
E-mail: larmacs@univ-skikda.dz 
www.univ-skikda.dz 

IV International Conference on Scour 
and Erosion 2008, ICSE-4 
Tokyo, Japan  
5 - 7 November 2008 
E-mail: sekiguch@ujigawa.mbox, 
media@kyoto-u.ac.jp 
http://icse-4.kz.tsukuba.ac.jp 

Geosynthetics India’ 08 
Hyderabad (Andhra Pradesh), India 
19 - 21 November 2008 
E-mail: uday@cbip.org;  
cbip@cbip.org 
http://www.cbip.org 

24th Mexican National Conference on 
Soil Mechanics 
Aguascalientes, Mexico 
26 - 29 November 2008 
Email: smms@prodigy.net.mx 

6th Asian Young Geotechnical Engi-
neers' Conference – Next Generation 
Geotechnics 
Bangalore, India 
20 - 21 December 2008 
E-mail: sitharam@civil.iisc.ernet.in 
www.civil.iisc.ernet.in/~igc2008/ 

FS-KGEO 2009 
Kunststoffe in der Geotechnik 
Munich, Germany 
12 Februar 2009 
E-mail: fskgeo@bv.tum.de 
http://www.gb.bv.tum.de/fachsektion/a_
veranstaltungen.htm 

Geosynthetics 2009 
Salt Lake City, Utah, USA 
25 - 27 Februar 2009 
http://www.geoshow.info/ 

7èmes Rencontres Geosynthetiques 
Nantes, France 
1 - 3 April 2009 
www.rencontresgeosynthetiques.org/ 

International Symposium on Prediction 
and Simulation Methods for Geohazard 
Mitigation 
Kyoto, Japan 
25 - 27 May 2009 
E-mail: foka@mbox.kudpc.kyoto-u.ac.jp 
www.nakisuna2.kuciv.kyoto-u.ac.jp/tc34
/is-kyoto/ 

Geo-Environmental Engineering 2009 
(GEE 2009) the 9th Joint Seminar on 
Geoenvironmental Engineering 
Vancouver, Canada 
10 - 12 June 2009 

IS-Tokyo 2009 - International Confer-
ence on Performance-Based Design in 
Earthquake Geotechnical Engineering  
Tsukuba, Japan 
15 - 17 June 2009 
E-mail: ytsoil@rs.noda.tus.ac.jp 
www.rs.noda.tus.ac.jp/ytsoil/IS2009.htm 

GeoAfrica 2009 
The First African Regional Con-
ference on Geosynthetics 
Cape Town, South Africa 
2 - 4 September, 2009 
www.geoafrica2009.org 
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XVII Int. Conference for Soil Mechanics 
and Geotechnical Eng. 
Alexandria, Egypt  
5 - 9 October 2009 
www.2009icsmge-egypt.org/ 

9th International Conference on 
Geosynthetics 
Guarujá, Brazil 
23 – 27 May 2010 
http://www.9icg-brazil2010.info 

Note:  
• Items in bold blue print are orga-

nized under the auspices of the 
IGS or with the support of the IGS. 

 
 

Corporate Membership 
 

Corporate Members of the IGS 
 
Argentina 
Coripa S.A. (2008) 
Austria 
Agru Kunststofftechnik GmbH 
(1996) 
Geofelt GmbH (1996) 
TenCate Geosynthetics Europe 
GmbH (1984) 
Belgium 
Beaulieu Technical Textiles 
(1998) 
Bonar Technical Fabrics N.V. 
(1985) 
Copro (2005) 
Brazil 
Engepol Geossintéticos Ltda 
(2001) 
Geosolutions Serviços em 
Geossintéticos Ltda. 
(2006) 
Maccaferri do Brasil Ltda 
(1998) 
Ramalho Comercial Ltda 
(2008) 
Canada 
Checkmate Geosynthetics 
(2006) 
Solmax International, Inc. 
(1997) 
Chile 
GSE Lining Technology Chile 
S.A. (2006) 
China (P.R.) 
Beijing Gaoneng Lining Engi-
neering Co., Ltd. (2006) 
Shenzhen Sheng Yi Environ-
mental Co., Ltd. (2002) 
Tensar Geosynthetics (Wuhan) 
Limited (2003) 
Colombia 
Geosistemas Pavco S.A. 
(1991) 
Costa Rica 
Servicios de Ingenieria Geosinte-
tica S.A. (SIGSA) (2008) 
Croatia 
Werkos (1999) 

Czech Republic 
Juta a.s. (1998) 
Denmark 
Fibertex A/S (1984) 
France 
Colas Group, The (1996) 
Texinov (2007) 
Terre Armee International 
(2002) 
Germany 
GSE Lining Technology GmbH 
(2004) 
Huesker Synthetic GmbH & Co. 
(1987) 
NAUE GmbH & Co. KG (1987) 
India 
Garware-Wall Ropes, Ltd. 
(2006) 
Reliance Industries (1998) 
Iran 
Chidak Baspar (2008) 
Iran Bana Arian (2005) 
Ireland 
F.L.I. Environmental 
(2002) 
Israel 
PRS Mediterranean, Ltd. 
(2003) 
Italy 
Alpe Adria Textil (2002) 
Arrigo Gabbioni Italia s.r.l. 
(2005) 
Edilfloor SpA (2002) 
GreenVision, S.p.A. (2004) 
Laviosa Chimica Mineraria 
(2002) 
Manifattura Fontana S.p.A. 
(2008) 
Officine Maccaferri S.P.A. 
(1997) 
TeMa Technologies and Materials 
Srl (2006) 
Tenax S.p.A. (1991) 
Viganò Pavitex S.P.A. 
(2006) 

Japan 
Araigumi Co., Ltd. (1999) 
Asahi Geotech Co., Ltd. 
(1984) 
Ashimori Industry Co., Ltd. 
(2003) 
Association of RRR Construction 
System, The (1998) 
Geosystem Co. Ltd. (2000) 
Hakogatayouheki Institute Co., 
Ltd. (2007) 
High Stiffness Polyethylene Pipes 
Association (2005) 
Hojun Yoko Co. Ltd. (2000) 
Integrated Geotechnology Insti-
tute Limited (1998) 
Japan Spunbond -- Toray Corp. 
(1984) 
Kajima Corporation (1985) 
Kuraray Co., Ltd. (1989) 
Maeda Kosen Co. Ltd. (1992) 
Mitsubishi Plastics, Inc. 
(1992) 
Mitsui Chemicals Industrial 
Products, Inc. (1992) 
Obayashi Corporation (1988) 
Okasan Livic Co. Ltd. (1984) 
Shimizu Corporation (1990) 
Taiyo Kogyo Co., Ltd. (Ocean) 
(1996) 
Taiyo Kogyo Corporation (SUN) 
(1991) 
Tanaka Co. Ltd. (1993) 
Tenox Corporation (2002) 
Tokyu Construction Co. Ltd. 
(1984) 
Tokyo Ink Co., Ltd. (2005) 
Korea 
Dae Han Industrial Material Co., 
Ltd. (1994) 
FITI Testing and Research Insti-
tute (1997) 
Mekamore Co., Ltd (2008) 
Samyang Corporation (2003) 
Luxembourg 
Du Pont de Nemours (Luxem-
bourg) S.A. (1984) 
Malaysia 
Emas Kiara SDN BHD (1999) 
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MiraCell CCS Sdn Bhd 
(2006) 
Mexico 
Geoliners de Mexico SA de CV 
(2006) 
Geosinteticos Origo SA C.V. 
(2008) 
New Zealand 
Permathene, Ltd. (2003) 
Norway 
CTH Geosynterer AS (2008) 
Tele Textiles AS (1995) 
Republic of Panama 
Aqua Terra (2008) 
Field Lining Services (1998) 
Russia 
Gidrokor, Ltd. (2004) 
OJSC “494 UNR” (2003) 
Tekpro (2008) 
Saudi Arabia 
Alyaf Industrial Company Ltd 
(2008) 
Geosynthetics Technologies Co., 
Ltd. 
(2007) 
Spain 
Atarfil S.L. (1999) 
BASF Construction Chemicals 
España, S.A. (2000) 
Dinagrid Geosynthetics S.L. 
(2005) 

Intermas Nets S.A. (2008) 
Punzonados Sabadell, S.A. 
(2000) 
TMA, S.L. (2000) 
Switzerland 
Fritz Landolt AG (1985) 
Swiss Association for Geosyn-
thetics SVG (1984) 
Taiwan R.O.C. 
Ace Geosynthetics (2003) 
Hui Kwang Corporation (2000)  
Seven States Enterprise Co., Ltd. 
(2005) 
 
The Netherlands 
Cofra BV (1991) 
Colbond bv. (1986) 
Ukraine 
Euroizol Geosynthetics 
(2006) 
United Arab Emirates 
BMC Gulf Trading & Contracting 
LLC (2008) 
Geotech L.L.C. (2007) 
United Kingdom 
ABG Limited (2001) 
Geofabrics Ltd. (1995) 
Linear Composites Limited. 
(2004) 
NewGrids Limited. (2004) 
Tensar International (1989) 
Terram Ltd. (1988) 

USA 
Alcoa Geosystems (1996) 
Belton Industries, Inc. (1989) 
Cetco (1992) 
Geosynthetic Materials Associa-
tion (GMA) (1985) 
geosynthetica.net (2006) 
GSE Lining Technology, Inc. 
(1988) 
I-CORP INTERNATIONAL (2006) 
Poly Flex, Inc. (1996) 
Propex (1991) 
Reinforced Earth Company, The 
(1989) 
Supertex, Inc. (2007) 
Tensar International Corporation 
(1989) 
TenCate Geosynthetics North 
America (1998) 
Venezuela 
Geosinteticos Trical, C.A. (2007) 
 
Notes:  
• A click to the name of the corpo-

rate member leads to the corre-
sponding entry at the IGS website. 
The corporate members are en-
couraged to check their entry 
there! 

• Date is earliest year of continuous 
membership 

 

Celebrating 20 Years of Corporate Membership 
 

 
Mr Masao Ito of Maeda Kosen accepting the 
Corporate Recognition Award for Kajima 
Corporation and for Asahi Kasei (Asahi 
Geotech Co. Ltd) from John Cowland at 
GeoSynthetics Asia 2008. 
 
On the occasion of the 25th of the 
IGS in 2008 the Society has initiated 
a program to recognize those cor-
porate members that have 20 years 
or more continuous membership. In 
2008 there are 18 such companies. 
In 2010, at the 9th ICG, the program 
will continue with as many as 6 
companies to be recognized.  

Recognition ceremonies and the 
presentation of a “gift” for each 
company will take place at the three 
IGS events in 2008, GeoAmericas in 
Cancun, Geosynthetics Asia in 
Shanghai and EuroGeo4 in Edin-
burgh. The companies to be recog-
nized are listed below. 
 
Award Ceremony at GeoAmericas 
08:  
• Geosynthetic Materials Associa-

tion (GMA), USA 
• NAUE GmbH & Co. KG, Germany 
 
Award Ceremony at GeoSynthetics 
Asia 2008: 
• Asahi Kasei Geotechnologies Co., 

Ltd., Japan 
• Kajima Corporation, Japan 
 
Award Ceremony at EuroGeo4: 
• Bonar Technical Fabrics N.V., 

Belgium 
• Colbond bv., The Netherlands 

• Du Pont de Nemours (Luxem-
bourg) S.A., Luxembourg 

• Fibertex A/S, Denmark 
• Fritz Landolt AG, Switzerland 
• GSE Lining Technology, Inc., USA 
• Huesker Synthetic GmbH & Co., 

Germany 
• Okasan Livic Co. Ltd., Japan 
• Swiss Association for Geosyn-

thetics SVG, Switzerland 
• TenCate Geosynthetics Europe 

GmbH, Austria 
• Terram Ltd., United Kingdom 
 
Award Ceremony to be fixed: 
• Japan Spunbond - Toray Corp., 

Japan 
• Obayashi Corporation, Japan 
• Tokyu Construction Co. Ltd., Ja-

pan 
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IGS Council 
 
Elected in 2006 
S. Allen (USA) 
G. Bräu (Germany) 
N. Dixon (United Kingdom) 
N. Freitag (France) 
M. Maugeri (Italy) 
J. Otani (Japan) 
E. Palmeira (Brazil) 
E. Peggs (USA) 
 
 

Co-opted in 2006 
M. Chen (China P.R.) 
J. Ferreyros (Peru) 
P. Legg (South Africa) 
P. Stevenson (USA) 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Elected in 2008 
D.T. Bergado (Thailand) 
A Bouazza (Australia) 
P. Fantini (Italy) 
H.Y. Jeon (Korea) 
R. Jones (United Kingdom) 
J. Kuwano (Japan) 
M. Sadlier (Australia) 
M.Ziegler (Germany) 
 
 

IGS Officers 
 
President 
Prof. Fumio Tatsuoka 
Tokyo University of Science 
Dept. of Civil Engineering 
2641 Yamazaki, Noda City 
Chiba Prefecture 278-8510 
JAPAN 
Tel: 81/47122 98190 
Fax: 81 47123 9766 
E-mail: tatsuoka@rs.noda.tus.ac.jp 
 

Vice-President 
Jorge G. Zornberg, PhD., P.E. 
The University of Texas at Austin 
Civil, Architectural & Environmental 
Engineering Department 
1 Univ. Station C1792 Rm ECJ9, 
227G 
Austin, Texas 78712-0280 USA 
Tel: 1/512 232 3595 
Fax: 1/512 471 6548 
E-mail: zornberg@mail.utexas.edu 
 

Immediate Past-President 
Dr.-Ing. Daniele A. Cazzuffi 
CESI SpA 
Via Rubattino, 54 
I - 20134 Milano 
ITALY 
Tel: 39/02 2125 5375 
Fax: 39/02 2125 5475 
E-mail: cazzuffi@cesi.it 
 
 

 
 
 
 

Treasurer 
Mr. John Cowland 
GeoSystems Ltd. 
38 Magazine Gap Road Fl#2 
Hong Kong, China 
Tel: 852/9884 
Fax: 852/2849 2918 
Email: cowland@netvigator.com 

Secretary 
Mr. Peter E. Stevenson 
226 Sitton Rd. 
Easley, SC 29642-8393 USA 
Tel: 1/864 855 0504 
Fax: 1/864 859 1698 
E-mail: igspete@aol.com 
 
 

IGS News Editor and Chapter Correspondents 
 
Editor 
Gerhard Bräu 
Technische Universität München–Zentrum Geotechnik 
Baumbachstrasse 7 
81245 München, Germany 
Tel: +49-89-289-27139 
Fax: +49-89-289-27189 
Email: g.braeu@bv.tum.de 
 
Chapter Correspondents 
Belgium, Frans De Meerleer, frans.texion@skynet.be  
Brasil, André Estêvão Silva, tesouraria@igsbrasil.org.br  
Germany, Gerhard Bräu, g.braeu@bv.tum.de  
Greece, Anastasios Kollios, akollios@edafomichaniki.gr  
India, G. Venkatappa Rao, gvrao.19@gmail.com  
Italy, Nicola Moraci, nicola.moraci@unirc.it  

Japan, Katsuhiko Makiuchi, 
makiuchi@trpt.cst.nihon-u.ac.jp  

North American Geosynthetics Society, L. David Suits, 
Nagsdirector@aol.com  

Norway, Hanne Louise Moe, hanne.l.moe@sintef.no  
Portugal, Madalena Barroso, mbarroso@lnec.pt  
Romania, Loretta Batali, Loretta@hidro.utcb.ro  
South Africa, Peter Davies, peter@kaytech.co.za  
South Korea, Myoung-Soo Won, 

wondain@kunsan.ac.kr  
Spain, Pedro L. Abad, Pedro.Abad@cetco.es  
Thailand, Ms. Lynn, igs-thailand@ait.ac.th  
Turkey, Orkun Akkol, orkunakkol@orientreserch.com  
West Pacific, San-Shyan Lin, 

ssLin@ntou66.ntou.edu.tw  
 

 
 

IGS News is published three times per year. Material for publication should be submitted to the Editor by 31 January, 31 May, and 30 September, 
for possible publication in the March, July, and November issues, respectively. 
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IGS Clothing 
 
IGS Logo Clothing is now available 
on-line. Hats, visors and various 
shirts can be viewed and ordered 

through the Members Only Section 
(www.geosyntheticssociety.org/me
mbersOnly/Login.asp) of the site. 

 
 
 

 
 

Imprint 
 

Visit the IGS Website:  
www.geosyntheticssociety.org 

 
IGS MEMBERSHIP REQUIRES ELECTRONIC COMMUNICATION – 
PLEASE ENSURE WE HAVE YOUR CURRENT E-MAIL ADDRESS 

 

IGS News is published  
by:  
International Geosynthetics Society 
P.O. Box 347  
Easley, SC 29641  
USA 
Tel: +1-864-855-0504 
Fax: +1-864-859-1698 
Email: IGSsec@aol.com 
 

For editorial enquiries  
contact: 
Mr. Gerhard Bräu 
Technische Universität München –  
Zentrum Geotechnik 
Baumbachstrasse 7 
81245 München 
Germany 
Tel: +49-89-289-27139 
Fax: +49-89-289-27189 
Email: g.braeu@bv.tum.de 
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The International Geosynthetics Society  
OBJECTIVES OF THE IGS 

 
The International Geosynthetics Society was formed with the following objectives: 
• to collect, evaluate, and disseminate knowledge on all matters relevant to geotextiles, geomembranes, related products, and associated tech-

nologies; 
• to improve communication and understanding regarding geotextiles, geomembranes, related products, and associated technologies, as well 

as their applications; 
• to promote advancement of the state of the art of geotextiles, geomembranes, related products, and associated technologies; and 
• to encourage, through its Members, the harmonization of test methods, and equipment and criteria for geotextiles, geomembranes, related 

products, and associated technologies. 
 

WHY BECOME A MEMBER OF THE IGS? 
 

First, to contribute to the development of our pro-
fession. 
 
By becoming an IGS Member you can: 
• help support the aims of the IGS, especially the development of 

geotextiles, geomembranes, related products, and associated 
technologies; 

• contribute to the advancement of the art and science of geotextiles, 
geomembranes, related products, and their applications; 

• provide a forum for designers, manufacturers, and users, where 
new ideas can be exchanged and contacts improved; and  

• become increasingly informed, involved, and influential in the field 
of geotextiles, geomembranes, related products, and associated 
technologies. 

Second, to enjoy the benefits. 
 
The following benefits are now available to all IGS Members: 
• the IGS Membership Directory, published yearly; 
• the newsletter, IGS News, published three times per year; 
• free electronic issues of Geosynthetics International and Geo-

textiles & Geomembranes; 
• a CD containing the 19 IGS Mini Lecture Series; 
• a DVD containing the three IGS Videos; 
• information on test methods and standards; 
• discount rates on the purchase of any future documents pub-

lished by the IGS and on the registration cost of all international, 
regional, or national conferences organized by or under IGS 
auspices; 

• preferential treatment at conferences organized by or under the 
auspices of the IGS; and 

• the possibility of being granted an IGS award. 
 

 
 

Please check whether there is a local IGS Chapter in your country! 
(see list at page 17 of this issue) 


